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FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE:

CYNTHIA A. HAINES JOINS POST & SCHELL’S HEALTH CARE PRACTICE

GROUP AS A PRINCIPAL

A 22-year Pennsylvania government legal veteran, Ms. Haines joins the Firm from
Department of Aging where she served as Department Counsel

HARRISBURG, PA – March 24, 2015 – Post & Schell, P.C. is pleased to announce that Cynthia A. Haines has
joined the Firm as a Principal in its Health Care Practice Group, resident in the Firm’s Harrisburg, PA Office. Ms.
Haines will work with the Firm’s institutional health care provider clients, including: hospitals; health systems;
home and community-based providers; LIFE programs; pharmacies enrolled in the PACE Program; and post-
acute care clients, on state and federal health law and related litigation, regulatory, and compliance issues.

Ms. Haines joins the Firm from the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania (PA), where she served in various legal
roles over 22 years. Most recently, she served as Department Counsel in the Commonwealth’s Department of
Aging, where she provided legal counsel and representation to the executive agency with approximately $1
billion in state and federal funding for programs for senior citizens in PA. Ms. Haines reviewed and counseled
the Commonwealth on all major legislation impacting the Department, including providing significant input on
proposed revisions to the Older Adults Protective Services Act and providing counsel throughout the
implementation of the Adult Protective Act which expands protective services to include adults with a disability
who are under 60 years old.

Additionally, Ms. Haines served as the Department of Aging’s Right to Know Law Legal Liaison, and
Pennsylvania’s Older Americans Act Legal Services Developer. She also represented the Department before the
Office of Open Records, Civil Service Commission, the Equal Employment Opportunities Commission, the PA
Human Rights Commission, the Bureau of Hearings and Appeals and Commonwealth Court.

“Cindy’s regulatory and governmental experience will prove to be invaluable to our health care clients,” said
Paula G. Sanders, Chair of the Firm’s Health Care Practice Group. “In particular, she has a deep understanding
of the challenges faced by service providers to seniors and individuals with disabilities in terms of governmental
oversight, quality of care, and compliance with the host of regulations these providers are subject to in
Pennsylvania, and nationally. Her skill and acumen are valuable additions to our Health Care Group, and the
Firm overall.”

“Over the course of my career in government, I’ve been consistently impressed by the work of Post & Schell
and its attorneys,” said Ms. Haines. “The Firm and its clients were a natural fit for my experience and
background as I transition from public to private practice. I look forward to collaborating with my new clients
and colleagues.”
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Prior to the PA Department of Aging, Ms. Haines served as the Director, Office of Market Analysis and
Education, in the Commonwealth’s Department of Insurance, where she oversaw the Department’s two
divisions responsible for Market Analysis and Consumer Liaison (education, outreach, public policy and
legislative review). She also worked for over 10 years in PA’s Department of Public Welfare as an Assistant Legal
Counsel, and helped defend the Commonwealth in an unprecedented class action suit brought against several
agencies for early intervention services for children.

Ms. Haines is a 1994 graduate of the Widener University School of Law, and holds a Bachelor of Science degree
from Muhlenberg College. She is a continuing legal education instructor on Protective Services, confidentiality,
aging services, ethics and other topics impacting elder law practice; and trained in mediation by the Governor’s
Office of General Counsel.

About Post & Schell, P.C.
Post & Schell, P.C. is committed to defining, measuring and achieving legal excellence. We provide
sophisticated legal services and strategic counseling to highly regulated industries and their directors, officers,
and stakeholders regionally, nationally and internationally. Our attorneys use intellectual rigor and seasoned
judgment to provide our clients with problem-solving and efficient representation in litigation, regulatory,
compliance, corporate and public policy matters.

Our focused legal product lines are vertically integrated into a variety of highly regulated industries including:
banking and financial services; commercial transportation; commercial construction; energy& utilities; health
care; hospitality; information technology and informatics; insurance; manufacturing; medical device; pharmacy
benefit management; pharmaceutical; and professional services.

With offices in Washington, D.C., Princeton, NJ, and Philadelphia, Pittsburgh, Harrisburg, Lancaster, and
Allentown, Pa., our attorneys represent industry regardless of venue or geographic market.

Learn more about Post & Schell at: www.PostSchell.com
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